
  

 
Service adult social care

Hammersmith & Fulham Council 
Town Hall, King Street 
Hammersmith 
London W6 9JU
 
Mr Fraser Rickatson

 

Reference: 4318110
 Email: icaseworkinformation@lbhf.gov.uk

Date: 13 June 2022

 
 
 
Dear Mr Rickatson
 
Freedom of Information Act 2000
 
I can confirm that the information requested is held by London Borough of 
Hammersmith and Fulham. I have enclosed copies of the information that is being 
released to you.  

Q1:  Please complete the following table for Residential and Nursing Care Home Fees 
for people over the age of 65:
 
Notes:

• All fees should exclude FNC and Top-Up payments but include any other 
resident contributions which make up the Local Authority fee.

• Minimum fee is the lowest base, starting rate or lowest rate paid for each care 
type.

• Maximum fee is the highest fee or cap to any fee or rate paid for each care type.
• Average fee is the average weekly fee paid during the month of April 2022 for 

each care type.
• Number of placements is the number of residents who make up the average fee 

by care type.
• Where different care types are used, such as care bandings, tier rates, or other 

fee structures, the minimum, maximum and average fee should be provided for 
the alternative care type used – see Q3 below.

Care Type Minimum 
or base 
weekly 
2022/23 
Fee

Maximum 
weekly 
2022/23 fee 
(if fees form 
part of a 
range)

Date fee 
was last 
uplifted*

Average 
weekly fee 
paid for all 
residents 
during April 
2022

Number of 
placements 
the Average 
fee relates 
to

Nursing £527 £1,613 01/04/2022 £823 133
Nursing with 
Dementia
Residential 
(without 
Nursing)

£501 £1,457 01/04/2022 £762 175



  

Residential 
(without 
Nursing) with 
Dementia

*If Fees have not yet been uplifted for 2022/23, please state the planned or estimated 
date of the 2022/23 annual fee uplift.

Expenditure is not recorded separately for dementia

Q2:  Please provide a copy of your 2022/23 fee uplift letter sent to providers outlining 
your approach to inflation, the decision regarding the uplift, and what the rates and/or 
percentage uplifts are.  Where you have not yet offered a fee uplift for 2022/23, please 
state when this will be communicated, and who we can contact at that time to request a 
copy of the uplift letter/correspondence.  If you were an authority which brought forward 
your uplift for 2022/23, please indicate this and provide the letter explaining the 
approach to providers.
See attached.

Q3:  Where you operate banded/tier rates or have multiple, or a range of rates for each 
care type, please indicate as such and provide the rate bandings or ranges and a link 
or explanation to how these are applied.  Where possible this should follow the format 
in Q1 for Minimum, Maximum, Average and the number of placements.
Expenditure is not recorded separately for dementia and see above the answer to Q1.

Q4:  Please outline your approach to care homes paying the National Living Wage, 
Real Living Wage or any other local variations or premiums associated to Care home 
staff pay and how this impacts the care provider in respect of the rates paid should they 
adopt different pay structures directed by the Council and if they choose not to do so.
All but one provider pay the London Living Way (the only exception is one care home 
who does not pay domestic staff the London Living Wage). H&F cannot comment on 
how this impacts the care provider in respect of the rates paid as the Council does not 
in this particular situation direct the pay structure. 

Q5:  To avoid further FOI’s, please provide a link to your website we can share with 
members where information relating to care home fees are published.
No information re. care home fees are available on the council’s website.

 
Please quote the reference number 4318110 in any future communications.

If you aren't happy with the council's response, please contact H&F within 40 working 
days of us sending you our response, with details of why you’re unhappy. 
You can do this by:

• visiting H&F’s website: https://www.lbhf.gov.uk/councillors-and-
democracy/complaints

• emailing handfintouch@lbhf.gov.uk

https://www.lbhf.gov.uk/councillors-and-democracy/complaints
https://www.lbhf.gov.uk/councillors-and-democracy/complaints
mailto:handfintouch@lbhf.gov.uk


  

• writing to the Resident Experience team, Hammersmith Town Hall, King Street, 
London, W6 9JU

Your concerns will be passed to H&F’s Information Management Team to consider as 
an internal review. There’s no charge for requesting an internal review.
 
 
If you are still dissatisfied with the Council’s response after the internal review you have 
a right of appeal to the Information Commissioner by:

• Writing to the Information Commissioner's Office (ICO), Wycliffe House, Water 
Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF

• Calling their helpline: 0303 123 1113
• Visiting the ICO’s website www.ico.org.uk/concerns/ 

The ICO are the UK’s independent authority set up to uphold information rights in the 
public interest.
 
I will now close your request as of this date.
 

Yours sincerely
 

Sarah Oneill
Business and Project Manager

http://www.ico.org.uk/concerns/


 

  

Email: uplift@lbhf.gov.uk 
Web: www.lbhf.gov.uk 
 
 
 
LBHF ref: JvW/ASC/Uplifts 
Email: uplift@lbhf.gov.uk 
 
 
To Whom It May Concern 
 
Without Prejudice  
 
Subject: Inflationary uplifts for Supported Living provision 2022/23  
 
We are writing to inform you of our annual uplift provision for the forth coming year. As 
a valued provider of Hammersmith & Fulham Council (H&F), we want to set out the 
Council’s position on inflationary uplifts for Supported Living services for the current 
financial year 1 April 2022 - 31 March 2023.   
 
In the spirit of equity and fairness we are applying a standard inflationary uplift of 4% 
across the sector.  
  
The council is taking part in the National Fair Cost of Care exercise which we will 
approach you for details of your support and breakdown of your expenditure. This 
exercise will be complete by September 2022 and we expect the evaluation and 
decision from government to be implemented by April 2023, therefore the inflationary 
uplift decision will be reviewed in line with the government guidance later in the year. 
 
All communications relating to the 2022/23 Uplift should be sent to the following 
email uplift@lbhf.gov.uk.  
  
It should be noted that any discussions relating to a change of circumstance or an 
increase in service needs do not fall under this uplift arrangement. 
 
We value the services you provide and want to thank you for your continued hard work 
and support.  
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
 
 
Johan van Wijgerden 
Strategic Commissioner Adult Social Care and Public Health Commissioning 
uplift@lbhf.gov.uk  

Hammersmith & Fulham Council 

Hammersmith Town Hall 
3 Shortlands 

London W6 8DA 

mailto:uplift@lbhf.gov.uk
mailto:uplift@lbhf.gov.uk

