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Richard Ayres rayres@careengland.org.uk
George Appleton GAppleton@careengland.org.uk

Dear Richard Ayres
FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 - INFORMATION REQUEST

Following receipt of your request for information on 17 December 2021 and our
acknowledgement of 18 December, and our extension on 19 January 2022, we
apologies for the delay in responding. The City of London (ColL) responds as
follows

This request seeks to collect data for individuals living in Supported Living and
Residential Care settings with Learning Disabilities and should include those
with Learning Disabilities and Autism. We are not asking for information related
to those with only Autism who do not have a Learning Disability. Please note
this request is for Adults 18-65 only.

LD Supported Living:

1. Please complete the following table with the information requested and state
the period the data relates to. The data period for the data below should
include the latest full calendar month for which this data is available within the
last 3 months. Please confirm the month the data is related to: N/A

(2021)
Category Mean Mean Median Lowest Highest
Number | hourly hourly hourly hourly
of Hrs rate paid | rate paid | rate paid | rate paid
per week

Hours
provided
during the
day N/A as only one placement
Wake hours
provided
during the
night
Sleep-ins
provided

Residential LD Care:

2. Please complete the following table with the information requested for the
period stated. The data period for the data below should include the latest full
calendar month for which this data is available and consist of 6 months data in
total. Please confirm the period the data is related to: July 2021 to January
2022



(2021 Residential

Category Mean rate Median rate | Lowest rate | Highest rate
paid paid paid paid

Placements 514.34 514.34 514.34 514.34

within the last

6 months

Placements in | 514.34 514.34 514.34 514.34

home longer

than 6 months

Current total One

placements

today

(2021 Residential

Care with Nursing)

Category

Mean rate
paid

Median rate
paid

Lowest rate
paid

Highest rate
paid

Placements
within the last
6 months

Placements in
home longer
than 6 months

N/A

Current total
placements
today

3. Please outline the 2022-23 timeline for Supported Living and Residential LD
care fee uplifts. Please include the process undertaken to establish provider
costs, the internal review process and any benchmarking process undertaken,
stating the decision makers, and timeline up to and including engagement and
communication with providers through to applying any uplift agreed.

The Col’s uplift process is under review for 2022/23. The process has
been to contact providers inviting them to submit their requests for an
uplift. The requests are benchmarked against the host borough. The
submitted requests are reviewed and decided on at Adult Social Care
management meetings.

4. Please provide the annual fee uplift information below for the last 5 years:

(Supported Living)

Year Percentage Number of Number of

uplift Providers receiving | Individuals receiving

this uplift this uplift

2021-22 0 0
2020-21 0 0 N/A
2019-20 2% 1 1
2018-19 0 0 N/A
2017-18 Information not held




(Residential Care)

Year Percentage Number of Number of
uplift Providers receiving | Individuals receiving
this uplift this uplift
2021-22 0 0 N/A
2020-21 0 0 N/A
2019-20 0 0 N/A
2018-19 0 0 N/A
2017-18 Information not held
(Residential Care with Nursing)
Year Percentage Number of Number of
uplift Providers receiving | Individuals receiving
this uplift this uplift
2021-22 0 0 N/A
2020-21 0 0 N/A
2019-20 0 0 N/A
2018-19 0 0 N/A
2017-18 Information not held

Please note that the City (the "Square Mile") has a resident population of about
10,938* which includes approximately 2,040 children aged up to 19 years old.

*Office of National Statistics June 2021

We hope this assists.

If you wish to make a complaint about the way the ColL has managed your
enquiry, please make your complaint in writing to email address;
Information.Officer@cityoflondon.gov.uk. For a link to the Col’s FOI complaints
procedure, please visit the following page: www.cityoflondon.gov.uk/Feedback,
at the end of which is located the FOI complaints procedure. If, having used the
Col’s FOI Complaints Procedure, you are still dissatisfied, you may request the
Information Commissioner to investigate. Please contact: Information
Commissioner, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF.
Telephone: (01625) 545700. Website: http://www.ico.org.uk/.

Please note that the Act applies to the City of London only as a local authority,
police authority and port health authority.

The CoL holds the copyright in this communication. Its supply does not give a
right to re-use in a way that would infringe that copyright, for example, by making
copies, publishing and issuing copies to the public or to any other person. Brief
extracts of any of the material may be reproduced under the fair dealing
provisions of the Copyright, Designs and Patents Act 1988 (sections 29 and 30)
for the purposes of research for non-commercial purposes, private study,
criticism, review and news reporting, subject to an acknowledgement of the
copyright owner.

Yours sincerely

Business Support Manager | Community and Children’s Services
Commissioning and Partnerships Division | City of London Corporation
Mob 07825 733846 | www.citvoflondon.aov.uk
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