M Leicestershire
Freedom of Information Act 2000 County Council

FOI 003707 - Residential Care and Learning Disabilities

Please accept this data request under the Freedom of Information Act as a Freedom of
Information Request.

This request seeks to collect data for individuals living in Supported Living and
Residential Care settings with Learning Disabilities and should include those with
Learning Disabilities and Autism. We are not asking for information related to those
with only Autism who do not have a Learning Disability. If the data you return is not
in keeping with this requirement, please explain so it can be noted if you have included
those with Autism only in your response.

LD Supported Living:

1. Please complete the following table with the information requested and state the
period the data relates to. The data period for the data below should include the
latest full calendar month for which this data is available within the last 3 months.
Please confirm the month the data is related to: Dec 21

**This is shared funding with Health.
So to ensure we only pay our share we adjust the hourly rate.

(2021)

Category Mean Mean Median Lowest Highest
Number | hourly rate | hourly rate | hourly rate | hourly rate
of Hrs paid paid paid paid
per week

Hours 35.2 £17.16 £16.34 £12.00 £28.37

provided

during the

day

Wake hours 22.9 £15.98 £16.34 £8.17 £18.41

provided

during the

night

Sleep-ins 20.9 £10.45 £10.77 £8.90 £17.18

provided

Unless otherwise stated, the information provided in response to this request is made available under the
Open Government Licence: http://www.nationalarchives.gov.uk/doc/open-government-licence/version/3/



http://www.nationalarchives.gov.uk/doc/open-government-licence/version/3/
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Residential LD Care:

2. Please complete the following table with the information requested for the period
stated. The data period for the data below should include the latest full calendar
month for which this data is available and consist of 6 months data in total. Please
confirm the period the data is related to:

New placements Jul — Dec 2021
Placements in home longer than 6 months comparison to 31/12/21
Averages — snapshot at 31/12/21 (cost data not available over a period)

(2021 Residential)

Category Mean rate | Median Lowest Highest
paid rate paid rate paid rate paid
(31/12/21) | (31/12/21) | (31/12/21) | (31/12/21)

Placements 3 £1,419.59 | £1,665.77 £615.00 £1,978.00

within the

last 6 months

Placements 251 £1,222.34 | £1,268.87 | £306.49 £3,025.89

in home

longer than 6

months

Current total 253

placements

today

(2021 Residential Care with Nursing)

Category Mean rate | Median Lowest Highest rate paid
paid rate paid rate paid
Placements There are no in county Nursing placements at Leicestershire
within the
last 6 months
Placements
in home
longer than 6
months
Current total
placements
today

Unless otherwise stated, the information provided in response to this request is made available under the
Open Government Licence: http://www.nationalarchives.gov.uk/doc/open-government-licence/version/3/
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3. Please outline the 2022-23 timeline for Supported Living and Residential LD care fee
uplifts. Please include the process undertaken to establish provider costs, the
internal review process and any benchmarking process undertaken, stating the
decision makers, and timeline up to and including engagement and communication
with providers through to applying any uplift agreed.

Freedom of Information Act 2000

In development; not available at the time of response

4. Please provide the annual fee uplift information below for the last 5 years:

(Supported Living)

Year Percentage Number of Providers | Number of Individuals
uplift receiving this uplift receiving this uplift

2021-22 | 1.97% on Information not held | Information not held
average

2020-21 | 5.79% on Information not held | Information not held
average

2019-20 | 4.60% on Information not held | Information not held
average

(Residential Care)

Year Percentage Number of Providers | Number of Individuals
uplift receiving this uplift receiving this uplift
2021-22 | 2% Approx. 150 Approx. 2,300
2020-21 | 4% Approx. 150 Approx. 2,300
2019-20 | N/a — different
fee structure

(Residential Care with Nursing)

Year Percentage Number of Providers | Number of Individuals
uplift receiving this uplift receiving this uplift
2021-22 | 2% Approx. 30 Approx. 75
2020-21 | 4% Approx. 30 Approx. 75
2019-20 | N/a — different
fee structure

Unless otherwise stated, the information provided in response to this request is made available under the
Open Government Licence: http://www.nationalarchives.gov.uk/doc/open-government-licence/version/3/
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